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Antimicrobial,	Wound	healing	and	Anti	mutagenic	Activity	of	Momordica	
charantia	Leaves	Extract

1.	INTRODUCTION
Karela	 [Momordica	 Charania, family Cucurbitaceous], It is a 
popular vegetable that is widely grown in tropical areas., It has 
been reported to have multiple in�luences on glucose and lipid 
metabolism [1, 2]. It has demonstrated activity against 
Helicobacter	pylori [the stomach ulcer-causing bacteria].	It has 
s h owe d  re s i s t a n c e  to  v i ra l  i n fe c t i o n s  a n d  h a d  a n 
immunostimulant effect in humans and animals, increasing 
interferon production and natural killer cell activity. of bitter 
melon against numerous cell lines, including liver cancer, 
human leukemia, melanoma, and solid sarcomas. [3, 4, 5] The 
bitter melon extract has also been reported to have antidiabetic 
Anticancerous antileukemic and anti-in�lammatory activities 
[6, 7, 8]

2.	MATERIALS	AND	METHODS
2.1	Extraction	Process
The Memordica	charantia	was collected from the local garden in 
the month of April 2020 and were identi�ied by competent 
Botanist Dr. Manoj Tripathi of DRI, Chitrakoot. The dried leaves 
were powdered.. The extraction was done as per the method 
reported.

2.1.2	Antibacterial	activity
The bacterial strains were obtained from the culture stock of the 
Department. The method was standardized by us and used the 
similar methods [9, 10, and 11].
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2.13	Micronucleus	assay
The  bone marrow aspirated from the femur bones of Swiss mice 
of treated and control groups, it was done as per the method 
reported by Schmidt [12] and by us [13.15].

Animal	model	for	wound	healing:	The wounds were created a 
wound healing activity was done as per the method described by 
Daniel et al [14].	Animals for this experiment were Swiss albino 
mice of group 3-4 months. 12 mice were used for the 
experiment, which were divided into 3 groups according to the 
treatment given. 

3.	RESULTS
3.1	Antibacterial	Assay
50% methanolic extract of present study revealed the 
antibacterial activity at the different concentrations in different 
bacterias as listed in table1 and 2.
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TABLE	1:	ANTIMICROBIAL	ACTIVITY	OF	Momordica	charantia	leaves	extract

The above observations suggest that different concentrations (25%, 50 %, 75 % & 100 %) were had good antibacterial activity 
against different	strains	of	bacteria	thus the extract is showing varying activity against all the microorganisms.

TABLE	2:	ANTIMICROBIAL	ACTIVITY	OF	Momordica	charantia	leaves	extract

Table	3:	Antibacterial	activity	against	the	known	gram	positive	antibiotic	

	TE-	Tetracycline,	OF-	O�loxacin,	AZ-	Azithromycin	&	PC-	Piperacilline

Table	4:	Antibacterial	activity	of	known	gram	negative	antibiotic	

FU-	Nitrofurantoin,	GM-	Gentamicin,	CX-	Cefotaxime	&	NF-	Nor�loxacin
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(A)	 MICRONUCLEUS	 ASSAY:- The mordica extract showed 
antimutagenic activity which was signi�icant in dose dose-
dependent manner. 

Pic.	I	Photograph	Showing	Micronucleus	Formation	in	PCE	Cells	

Table	5:	Effect	of	Momodica	Charantia	Leaves	Extract	on	Mn	Formation	in	Mouse	Bone	
Marrow	Cell

*Denoted	statistically	signi�icant	as	compared	to	the	cyclophosphamide-treated	group	[16]

Table	6;	Effect	of	Momordica	Extract	on	wound	healing	activity	in	Swiss	albino	mice.	

Topical application of Momordica extract at a dose of 100 ul. had 
shown wound healing activity on the skin of Swiss mice. The 
wound created by the excision method was completely healed 
after 15 days but in 8-15 days, the wound healing by Momordica 
extract was greater than Betadine-treated group (Positive 
control).
 
Discussion	and	Conclusion
The Signi�icant wound healing activity was observed in animals 
treated with Momordica extract compared with those who 
received the standard and control treatment. our study was 
supported the �indings by the �indin of Sensagal, (2015,David et 
al 2014 Dandavate et al 2016. In excision wound modal, 
Momordica extract-treated animals showed a signi�icant 
reduction in wound area and period of epithelization. 

The present study is important because the Momordica	
charantia	 plant is important to cure various ailments in 
traditional medicine since diabetes is spreading in all over the 
world as an epidemic and there is no permanent treatment in 
allopathy; therefore, people are looking for alternative medicine 
for the treatment of diabetes.
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